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Prepare to be captivated once again by the enthralling world of "The
Selection" in this exclusive companion novella. Delve into the lives of the
enigmatic Elite, uncover their hidden motivations, and witness firsthand the
complexities that shape their existence within the opulent and treacherous
world of the Selection.

Unravel the Secrets of the Elite

Step into the opulent ballrooms and behind the closed doors of the palace
to discover the true nature of the Elite. Each chapter in this captivating
novella alternates perspectives, offering intimate glimpses into the minds of
different characters and their unique experiences within the Selection.
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Witness the struggles of Prince Maxon as he grapples with the weight of
his responsibilities and the pressure to choose a bride who will not only
fulfill his duty but also capture his heart. Follow the transformation of
Marlee, a seemingly unassuming servant girl who finds herself torn
between her loyalty to the crown and her forbidden love for a guard.

Explore the cunning strategies of Celeste, a manipulative and ambitious
Elite who is determined to secure her place as Maxon's future queen.
Uncover the hidden desires of Aspen, a kind-hearted guard who is torn
between his love for America and his duty to protect the Selection.

Forbidden Love and Dangerous Intrigues

As the competition intensifies, the lines between love and duty blur. The
Elite find themselves navigating a treacherous path, where forbidden
romances ignite and dangerous games are played. Witness the blossoming
love between Marlee and Carter, a forbidden connection that threatens to
shatter societal norms.

Follow the heart-wrenching journey of America and Aspen, as they face the
consequences of their secret affair. Experience the sinister machinations of
Celeste, who will stop at nothing to eliminate her rivals and secure her
place alongside Maxon.

In this gripping companion novella, Kiera Cass masterfully weaves a tale of
love, betrayal, and the complexities of power. Prepare to be captivated by
the untold stories of the Elite and the secrets that lie hidden beneath the
glittering facade of the Selection.

Escape into the Enchanting World of "The Selection"



Whether you're a longtime fan of "The Selection" series or a newcomer
eager to delve into this captivating world, "Companion to The Selection:
The Selection Novella" is an essential read. This exclusive novella offers a
tantalizing glimpse into the lives of the Elite, unraveling their hidden
motivations and providing a fresh perspective on the events of the original
trilogy.

Escape into the opulent ballrooms, navigate the treacherous court politics,
and witness the forbidden romances that ignite in the opulent palace. Join
the Elite as they face their greatest challenges and make life-altering
decisions that will shape their destinies and the future of their kingdom.

Don't miss out on this captivating companion piece to "The Selection"
series. Free Download your copy of "Companion to The Selection: The
Selection Novella" today and delve into the enchanting world of Kiera
Cass's beloved creation.
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Pandemic with Dogs: Two Essays
By Susannah Charleson In the midst of the COVID-19 pandemic, as the
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